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A practical guide to developing and deploying Near Field Communication (NFC) applications

There has been little practical guidance available on NFC programming, until now. If you're a programmer
or developer, get this unique and detailed book and start creating apps for this exciting technology. NFC
enables contactless mobile communication between two NFC-compatible devices. It's what allows customers
to pay for purchases by swiping their smartphones with Google Wallet, for example. This book shows you
how to develop NFC applications for Android, for all NFC operating modes: reader/writer, peer-to-peer, and
card emulation.

The book starts with the basics of NFC technology, an overview of the Android OS, and what you need to
know about the SDK tools. It then walks you through all aspects of NFC app development, including SE
programming. You'll find all you need to create an app, including functioning, downloadable code and a
companion website with additional content. Valuable case studies help you understand each operating mode
in clear, practical detail.

Shows programmers and developers how to develop Near Field Communication (NFC) applications for●

Android, including Secure Element (SE) programming
Expert authors are NFC researchers who have a deep knowledge of the subject●

Covers app development in all NFC operating modes: reader/writer, peer-to-peer, and card emulation●

Includes valuable case studies that showcase several system design and analysis methods, such as activity●

diagram, class diagram, UML, and others

Professional NFC Application Development for Android offers the clear, concise advice you need to create
great applications for this emerging and exciting technology.
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From reader reviews:

Erin Weiss:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to understand everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it
means that e-book has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They
are really reading whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person
who don't like reading a book? Sometime, individual feel need book if they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will need this Professional NFC Application Development for Android.

Myrtle McDonald:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take
a move, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed Professional
NFC Application Development for Android? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree
with it has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Christopher Hardnett:

The publication with title Professional NFC Application Development for Android includes a lot of
information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This kind of book
exist new understanding the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world
today. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you
inside new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item
anywhere you want.

Mary Otter:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen want book to know the update information of year to be able to year. As we know those books have
many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. From the book
Professional NFC Application Development for Android we can have more advantage. Don't you to be
creative people? For being creative person must like to read a book. Just choose the best book that suitable
with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life with that book Professional NFC Application
Development for Android. You can more pleasing than now.
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