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Franklin Roosevelt was America's President when Eddie Robinson coached his first game. Fifty-seven years
later, Robison left Grambling as the winningest coach in the history of college football. Initially a coach for a
segregated society, Eddie Robinson has helped football transcend race in the America he loves and treasures.
Yet institutionalized racial barriers kept Robinson a secret from white America for more than 25 years until
Howard Cosell did an ABC special on Grambling in the late 1960s. Outside of the world of sport, white
America still barely knows him. In the African-American community, he is very likely the best-known coach
in America. He is surely the most beloved.

Never Before, Never Again chronicles Coach Robinson's life and his time at Grambling in vivid detail. He
overcame all those things that might have predicted that it was not possible for the son of a sharecropper and
a domestic worker to become a success. He got a master's degree, became the president of the American
Football Coaches Association, and helping thousands of young boys become outstanding men. More than
wins, they may be his greatest legacy.

But as much as Coach Robinson's memoir is about sports, it's a social history history as well. The book is a
lens through which readers can see the challeges and turmoil of the civil rights movements from the
perspective of a sports figure who worked the playing fields of a black campus while caring deeply about the
stakes and outcome of the struggle . This book places the hard-news events of the day in the time frame of
the trails of Robinson's Grambling teams of that era. Also included are the thoughts of other coaches (both
college and NFL) on Coach Robinson, as well as those of national leaders like Reverend Jesse Jackson, M.J.
"Mike" Foster, the governor of Lousiana, and President Clinton.

Never Before, Never Again stands as lasting testimony to the work of a true American hero.
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From reader reviews:

Debra Yarbrough:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Never Before, Never Again: The Autobiography of
Eddie Robinson. Try to face the book Never Before, Never Again: The Autobiography of Eddie Robinson as
your close friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you experience alone and beside regarding
course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you considerably
more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make new experience in
addition to knowledge with this book.

Irene Weinstein:

This book untitled Never Before, Never Again: The Autobiography of Eddie Robinson to be one of several
books this best seller in this year, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon
it. You will easily to buy that book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on
this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read this book in
your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for you to past this book from your list.

Bernetta Smith:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on
book like comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not attempting Never
Before, Never Again: The Autobiography of Eddie Robinson that give your satisfaction preference will be
satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the means for
people to know world considerably better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be
explained constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to
possibly be success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your good habit, you are able to
pick Never Before, Never Again: The Autobiography of Eddie Robinson become your starter.

Mildred Shaw:

You will get this Never Before, Never Again: The Autobiography of Eddie Robinson by look at the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve issue if you get difficulties on your
knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by means of written or printed but additionally can
you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking from your mobile
phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information
about your reserve. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still update. Let's try
to choose correct ways for you.
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