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It is no coincidence that presidential candidates have been making it a point to add the late-night comedy
circuit to the campaign trail in recent years. In 2004, when John Kerry decided it was time to do his first
national television interview, he did not choose CBS' "60 Minutes", ABC's "Nightline", or "NBC Nightly
News". Kerry picked Comedy Central's "The Daily Show". When George W. Bush was lagging in the polls,
his appearance on the "David Letterman Show" gave him a measurable boost. Candidates for the 2008
presidential election began their late-night bookings almost as soon as they launched their campaigns.How
can this be? The reason is that polls have been consistently finding that a significant number of Americans -
and an even larger proportion of those under the age of thirty - get at least some of their "news" about
politics and national affairs from comedy shows. While this trend toward what some have called
"infotainment" seems to herald the descent of our national discourse - the triumph of entertainment over
substance - the reality, according to Russell L. Peterson, is more complex. He explains that this programming
is more than a mere replacement for traditional news outlets; it plays its own role in shaping public
perception of government and the political process.From Johnny Carson to Jon Stewart, from Chevy Chase's
spoofing of President Ford on "Saturday Night Live" to Stephen Colbert's roasting of President Bush at the
White House Correspondents Dinner, Strange Bedfellows explores what Americans have found so funny
about our political institutions and the people who inhabit them, and asks what this says about the health of
our democracy. Comparing the mainstream network hosts - Jay, Dave, Conan, and Johnny before them - who
have always strived to be "equal opportunity offenders" to the newer, edgier crop of comedians on cable
networks, Peterson shows how each brand of satire plays off a different level of Americans' frustrations with
politics.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Darby:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night
Comedy Turns Democracy into a Joke will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more
confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think that will open or reading some
sort of book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you
searching for best book or appropriate book with you?

Jennifer Trojanowski:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important for us. The book Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy Turns
Democracy into a Joke had been making you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take
more information. It is very advantages for you. The reserve Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy
Turns Democracy into a Joke is not only giving you considerably more new information but also for being
your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your guide. Try to
make relationship together with the book Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy Turns Democracy
into a Joke. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Johnny Abel:

This Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy Turns Democracy into a Joke book is simply not
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is
definitely information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper a person
read a lot of information you will get. This specific Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy Turns
Democracy into a Joke without we realize teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating
and analyzing. Don't always be worry Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy Turns Democracy into
a Joke can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because
you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Strange Bedfellows: How Late-Night Comedy Turns
Democracy into a Joke having very good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not sense uninterested
in reading.

Nancy Bowers:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Strange Bedfellows: How Late-



Night Comedy Turns Democracy into a Joke book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of
course the knowledge in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.
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