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“Habitats" is the seventh in a series of near future SciFi/Thrillers whose young heroine Ell Donsaii has a
nerve mutation which has made her a genius as well as an athletic phenomenon. In “Habitats,” she is
continuing to find uses for the quantum entangled wormholes that she discovered. These wormholes aren’t
big enough to send people through, yet they are making huge changes in our world. After a friend lost his
hand, Ell finds a way to use ports to build better prostheses for amputees! However, there are terrorists
wanting to use ports to cause destruction and the military arms of some countries covet them as well. Ell
must try to prevent such people from obtaining the technology and using it for harm. Meanwhile, her small
company is trying to build a habitat in space and one of her rockets has discovered a mind boggling habitat at
Sigma Draconis.
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From reader reviews:

Lorenzo McAvoy:

The book Habitats (an Ell Donsaii story #7) (Ell Donsaii Stories) (Volume 7) can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing
like a book Habitats (an Ell Donsaii story #7) (Ell Donsaii Stories) (Volume 7)? A number of you have a
different opinion about e-book. But one aim this book can give many data for us. It is absolutely suitable.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book Habitats (an Ell Donsaii story #7) (Ell Donsaii Stories) (Volume 7)
has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous
world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Henry Carlino:

What do you about book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
spare time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question
simply because just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it
is proper. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific Habitats (an Ell Donsaii story
#7) (Ell Donsaii Stories) (Volume 7) to read.

John Threadgill:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to
be smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Habitats (an Ell Donsaii story #7) (Ell
Donsaii Stories) (Volume 7) book as this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the
knowledge in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Robert Bryant:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of numerous ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the
characters do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Habitats
(an Ell Donsaii story #7) (Ell Donsaii Stories) (Volume 7), you could tells your family, friends and soon
about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a reserve.
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