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Near the end of the Apollo 15 mission, David Scott and fellow moonwalker James Irwin conducted a secret
ceremony unsanctioned by NASA: they placed on the lunar soil a small tin figurine called “The Fallen
Astronaut,” along with a plaque bearing a list of names. This book enriches the saga of mankind’s greatest
scientific undertaking, Project Apollo, and conveys the human cost of the space race – by telling the stories
of those sixteen astronauts and cosmonauts who died reaching for the moon.
 
Many people are aware of the Apollo launch pad disaster in which three men lost their lives, but few know of
the other five fallen astronauts whose stories this book tells as well: among them, Ted Freeman and C.C.
Williams, who died in the crashes of their -38 jets; the “Gemini Twins,” Charlie Bassett and Elliot See, killed
when their jet slammed into the building where their Gemini capsule was undergoing final construction; and
Ed Givens, whose fatal car crash has until now been obscured by rumors. The extraordinary lives and
accomplishments of these and other fallen astronauts – including eight Russian cosmonauts who lost their
lives during training – unfold here in intimate and compelling detail, supported by extensive interviews and
archival material. Their stories return us to a stirring time in the history of our nation and remind us of the
cost of fulfilling our dreams.
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From reader reviews:

Cindy Gross:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of
activity do you have when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the
book you have read is Fallen Astronauts: Heroes Who Died Reaching for the Moon.

Brett Baker:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim
to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't work
at this point is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer might be Fallen Astronauts: Heroes Who Died Reaching for the Moon
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The
inside or content is definitely fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show
you to pick up this book.

David Fulton:

It is possible to spend your free time to read this book this guide. This Fallen Astronauts: Heroes Who Died
Reaching for the Moon is simple to bring you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train in addition to
soon. If you did not include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is
make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when one buys this book.

Jennifer Stephens:

You can obtain this Fallen Astronauts: Heroes Who Died Reaching for the Moon by look at the bookstore or
Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book
through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching
what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for
you.
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