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The theory of analytic functions of several complex variables enjoyed a period of remarkable development in
the middle part of the twentieth century. After initial successes by Poincare and others in the late 19th and
early 20th centuries, the theory encountered obstacles that prevented it from growing quickly into an
analogue of the theory for functions of one complex variable. Beginning in the 1930s, initially through the
work of Oka, then H. Cartan, and continuing with the work of Grauert, Remmert, and others, new tools were
introduced into the theory of several complex variables that resolved many of the open problems and
fundamentally changed the landscape of the subject. These tools included a central role for sheaf theory and
increased uses of topology and algebra. The book by Gunning and Rossi was the first of the modern era of
the theory of several complex variables, which is distinguished by the use of these methods. The intention of
Gunning and Rossi's book is to provide an extensive introduction to the Oka-Cartan theory and some of its
applications, and to the general theory of analytic spaces. Fundamental concepts and techniques are
discussed as early as possible. The first chapter covers material suitable for a one-semester graduate course,
presenting many of the central problems and techniques, often in special cases. The later chapters give more
detailed expositions of sheaf theory for analytic functions and the theory of complex analytic spaces. Since
its original publication, this book has become a classic resource for the modern approach to functions of
several complex variables and the theory of analytic spaces.
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From reader reviews:

Herman Pruitt:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Analytic Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea
Publishing) book is readable by means of you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info here
are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to
give to you. The writer associated with Analytic Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea
Publishing) content conveys the thought easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the information but it just different in the form of it. So , do you continue to thinking Analytic
Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea Publishing) is not loveable to be your top collection
reading book?

Verna Tubbs:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled Analytic Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea Publishing) your mind will drift
away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely might be your
mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become one form conclusion and explanation this
maybe you never get prior to. The Analytic Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea
Publishing) giving you one more experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful
data for your better life in this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern here is your body and
mind will be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Betty Brown:

This Analytic Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea Publishing) is brand-new way for you
who has interest to look for some information as it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting
knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having little digest in reading this Analytic Functions of
Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea Publishing) can be the light food for yourself because the
information inside this particular book is easy to get by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which
can be reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in book form make them
feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is no in reading a book especially this one. You can
find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book sort for
your better life and knowledge.

Bruce Sandlin:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was



exactly added. This book Analytic Functions of Several Complex Variables (AMS Chelsea Publishing) was
filled about science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some
people has several feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can
sense enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.
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