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This completely updated second edition of MICROCONTROLLERS: FROM ASSEMBLY LANGUAGE
TO C USING THE PIC24 FAMILY covers assembly language, C programming, and hardware interfacing
for the Microchip PIC24 family, a recently updated microcontroller family from Microchip. Hardware
interfacing topics include parallel port usage, analog-to-digital conversion, digital-to-analog conversion, the
serial peripheral bus (SPI), the inter-integrated circuit bus (I2C), asynchronous serial communication, and
timers. Assembly language programming is covered in the context of the PIC24 instruction set, and no initial
knowledge of assembly language programming is assumed. Specific hardware interfacing topics covered are
parallel IO, analog-to-digital/digital-to-analog conversion, pulse width modulation, timer usage for IO
polling, and industry standard serial interface standards. Interfacing examples include external devices such
as pushbutton switches, LEDs, serial EEPROMs, liquid crystal displays (LCDs), keypads, rotary encoders,
external digital-to-analog converters, DC motors, servos, temperature sensors, and IR receivers. Master the
PIC24 family with MICROCONTROLLERS: FROM ASSEMBLY LANGUAGE TO C USING THE PIC24
FAMILY.
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From reader reviews:

Stephen Galvan:

Book is written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-book. Book
has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world. Next to that you
can your reading skill was fluently. A publication Microcontrollers: From Assembly Language to C Using
the PIC24 Family will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or reading a new book make you bored. It
isn't make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate
book with you?

Roger Richmond:

The experience that you get from Microcontrollers: From Assembly Language to C Using the PIC24 Family
is a more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic about
reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Microcontrollers: From Assembly Language
to C Using the PIC24 Family giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point
in selected way that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this publication
is well-known enough. This book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to
understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for
having this kind of Microcontrollers: From Assembly Language to C Using the PIC24 Family instantly.

Thomas Crittenden:

This Microcontrollers: From Assembly Language to C Using the PIC24 Family is great reserve for you
because the content which is full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have to
make decision every minute. This book reveal it facts accurately using great plan word or we can declare no
rambling sentences in it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides you with straight forward sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering
sentences. Having Microcontrollers: From Assembly Language to C Using the PIC24 Family in your hand
like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no reserve that offer
you world with ten or fifteen second right but this e-book already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey
Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

Virginia White:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. With this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
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