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A modern-day theologian’s call for the radical transformation of Christianity

• Echoes the Reformation initiated by Martin Luther in 1517

• Addresses the corruption and authoritarian tendencies that distinguish today’s Christian institutions from
the spiritual message upon which they are founded

• Offers a new vision of Christianity that values the Earth, honors the feminine, and emphasizes spiritual
tolerance

In 1517, Martin Luther, disgusted at the corruption then reigning in the Catholic Church, nailed on the door
of Castle Church in Wittenberg, Germany, 95 theses calling for a Reformation. During Pentecost week 2005,
former Dominican priest Matthew Fox nailed at that same church door a new set of 95 theses calling for a
reawakening of the Christian spirit and a repudiation of the authoritarian, punitive tendencies that prevail in
modern churches today. Fox’s theses not only condemn the deep corruption in the hierarchy of the Roman
Catholic Church, made evident by the pedophile scandal and the recent canonization of a fascist admirer of
Hitler, but also speak to the loss of inspiration and resulting apathy that have emptied churches of all
denominations.

Fox says, “At this critical time in human and planetary history, when the earth is being ravaged by the
violence of war, poverty, sexism, homophobia, and eco-destruction, we need to gather those who offer a
future that is one of compassion, creativity, and justice to speak their conscience as never before. Religion
ought to be part of the solution, not the problem.” His 95 theses call for a New Reformation, a radical
transformation that will allow us to move once again from the hollow trappings of organized religion to
genuine spirituality.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Barton:

This A New Reformation: Creation Spirituality and the Transformation of Christianity are generally reliable
for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The reason of this A New Reformation: Creation
Spirituality and the Transformation of Christianity can be among the great books you must have is giving
you more than just simple examining food but feed an individual with information that probably will shock
your previous knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions in e-book and printed versions. Beside that this A New Reformation: Creation Spirituality and the
Transformation of Christianity giving you an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving
you trial of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and enjoy
reading.

Albert Collins:

This book untitled A New Reformation: Creation Spirituality and the Transformation of Christianity to be
one of several books in which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this publication you can
get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy that book in the book store or you can order it via online. The
publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this
book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for you to past this guide from your list.

Stephanie Armstrong:

This A New Reformation: Creation Spirituality and the Transformation of Christianity is great publication
for you because the content that is full of information for you who also always deal with world and also have
to make decision every minute. This book reveal it data accurately using great organize word or we can
declare no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't
mean it only provides straight forward sentences but difficult core information with splendid delivering
sentences. Having A New Reformation: Creation Spirituality and the Transformation of Christianity in your
hand like finding the world in your arm, info in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no guide that
offer you world throughout ten or fifteen tiny right but this e-book already do that. So , this really is good
reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?

Chuck Bryson:

Is it a person who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This A New Reformation: Creation
Spirituality and the Transformation of Christianity can be the response, oh how comes? It's a book you
know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a geek
activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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