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This is an electronic version of the three printed volumes of ICD-10, which offers the following features:

Intuitive and easy-to-use interface;

Simple to navigate - complete with its own browser and hypertext links;

Fully searchable with every word, number, and alphanumeric indexed;

Keyword searching and user-defined search facility;

Versatile format that can be annotated with user's notes;

Extracts from ICD-10 can be printed and copied into other applications;

Small file size, which will remain compressed after installation;

IBM-Compatible PC under Windows® 95/98 NT 2000 XP and Me or later.

Please note:

This product is available for use on a single terminal based computer and/or a laptop/notebook computer.

This new edition of WHO's International Statistical Classification of Diseases and Related Health Problems,
10th Revision (ICD-10) has been fully updated. Originally published in the early 1990s, ICD-10 now
incorporates all updates and other changes to this core health classification since 1996 up to end 2003.

In 2000, WHO formed an international panel to review and collate all adjustments to the ICD-10 proposed
by many institutions around the world. Panel members consult several times a year and this definitive second
edition of ICD-10 is the result of their work. The new edition has hundreds of updates, and includes new
diseases such as SARS, to ensure that the classification is entirely suited to today's needs.

Improvements have been made to the rules and guidelines for mortality coding, making them easier to
implement and which will result in the improved comparability of international mortality statistics. In
addition, there are many additions and changes to the alphabetical index resulting in some 60 additional
pages, making it far more comprehensive than that of the first edition.
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From reader reviews:

Shane Bodine:

The book The International Statistical Classification of Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-10:
Volume 1: Tabular List make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable much
more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting stress or having big problem using your
subject. If you can make looking at a book The International Statistical Classification of Diseases and Health
Related Problems: ICD-10: Volume 1: Tabular List to become your habit, you can get much more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You are
able to know everything if you like wide open and read a book The International Statistical Classification of
Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-10: Volume 1: Tabular List. Kinds of book are several. It means
that, science guide or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this e-book?

James Drennan:

The book untitled The International Statistical Classification of Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-
10: Volume 1: Tabular List contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with
easy method. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read
it. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new era of literary works. You can
easily read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book
throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site and
also order it. Have a nice study.

Evelyn Wiley:

This The International Statistical Classification of Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-10: Volume
1: Tabular List is completely new way for you who has fascination to look for some information mainly
because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this The International Statistical
Classification of Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-10: Volume 1: Tabular List can be the light
food for you because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by anyone. These books create
itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in
book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a
guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss
that! Just read this e-book style for your better life and also knowledge.

Reuben Beaubien:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose the particular book The International Statistical
Classification of Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-10: Volume 1: Tabular List to make your own



personal reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading expertise is developing when you just like reading.
Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the feeling about book and studying
especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the guide
The International Statistical Classification of Diseases and Health Related Problems: ICD-10: Volume 1:
Tabular List can to be a newly purchased friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse in what must you're
doing of that time.
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